FW: [EXTERNAL]JFW: W Hotel - New Revision

Subject: FW: [EXTERNAL]FW: W Hotel - New Revision

From: Roxanne Holt <Roxanne.Holt@vulcanhart.com>

Date: 3/1/2021, 4:30 PM

To: "ddb@davidbethel.com" <ddb@davidbethel.com>

CC: "Galle, Shannon" <Shannon.Galle@trimarkusa.com>, Dan Peckaitis - Squirer Associates <dpeckaitis@squierinc.com>

Hi David!

This is the latest design for the W Hotel. Would it be possible to have the designs back before 10am tomorrow?

Vulcan V2FT36C Vulcan VFRY 18
Vulcan 36IRB-N

Thank you,

Roxanne Holt (she/her)
Vulcan/Wolf — Ranges
Baltimore, MD
410-800-5192

From: Galle, Shannon <Shannon.Galle@trimarkusa.com>

Sent: Monday, March 1, 2021 4:28 PM

To: Roxanne Holt <Roxanne.Holt@vulcanhart.com>; Dan Peckaitis - Squirer Associates <dpeckaitis@squierinc.com>
Cc: Galle, Shannon <Shannon.Galle@trimarkusa.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL]FW: W Hotel - New Revision

[EXTERNAL]
See attached for the layout as it stands now.

How soon can | get the 3-D picture. | need tomorrow by 10 am.

Possible?
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FW: [EXTERNAL]FW: W Hotel - New Revision

| . Shannon Galle
@ } Tr]Mark Senior Equipment & Design Specialist
". ] s ‘ Trimark Adams-Burch, 1901 Stanford Ct., Landover, MD 20785
Foodsenice Bquipment Supplies and Dten | 31 576 2088 | M 703.708.4595 | F 301,386,028 | Shannon.Galle@trimarkusa.com

ADAMS-BURCH www.trimarkusa.com i f W D)

TriMark Adams-Burch is updating our remit to address. Please send payments to: TriMark Adams-Burch, PO Box 845396, Boston, MA 02284-5396.
Thank you again for your continued business!

COVID-18 Relief & Recovery
Health, Safety & Sanitation Ly
Tips for Continued Operation ACCESS OUR RESOURCES »

WE'RE ALL IN THIS TOGETHER! LET US HELP.  § ﬁ ‘?

This transmission is CONFIDENTIAL and the information is intended only for the use of the individual or entity to whom it is addressed. If you are not the
intended recipient, or the employee or agent responsible for delivering it to the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any use, dissemination,
distribution or copying of this communication is STRICTLY PROHIBITED. If you have received the transmission in error, please immediately notify us by
e-mail and/or telephone, and delete the transmission and any attachments from your mailbox. Thank you.

—Attachments:

WHotel-Model4.pdf 11.1 KB
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